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AS WORK BEGINS ON NEW CANCER CENTER

Major Parking Changes Are Announced
One of the first major results from the new
hospital identification badges will be orderly
transition to new parking arrangements at Cedar
Crest & 1-78.

Because of the coming construction of the new
cancer center, in the vicinity of the two medical
office buildings, parking for employees will be
rearranged - but the new ID badges will allow
access to lots for all employees and improve
security.

Work is expected to begin soon on temporarily
expanding one parking area before starting to
tear up existing spaces. The goal is to minimize
disruption of parking for employees, visitors and
patients.

The most substantive part of parking lot alter-
ations during construction will be the loss of

spaces at the MOB end of the site. During
construction, special arrangements are planned
for employees and patients at the Medical Office
Buildings to ensure adequate and convenient
parking.

Meanwhile, visitor parking at the main hospital
building will also be disrupted because of
construction. To accommodate visitors, clergy
and volunteers, parking will be extended into
what is nowaday shift lot near the MedEvac
hangar and modular units. Day shift will move
into what is now used for middle shift, and that
lot will be expanded to provide sufficient places
for all. It will be a card-access lot.

Middle shift, which Security defines as employ-
ees working past 9 p.m., will move into a section

Continued on Page 4

And 5,600 'Give Me A Smiles'Laten..
In just two weeks, nearly 5,600 images of
hospital employees, volunteers, medical staff and
visiting clergy were gathered by Security as the
initial step in preparing a new set of Lehigh
Valley Hospital identification badges.

The next step is to print out the cards, install
magnetic strips to encode a variety of informa-
tion, laminate them and distribute to each
department.

At the time of distribution, expected in several
weeks, Security will collect old cards, which will
no longer operate various locks and gates
throughout the system.

Meanwhile, the introductory offer ofT-shirts
bearing the hospital's new logo was so popular
that supplies were exhausted twice. This meant
many employees placed orders for specific sizes,
and those shirts will be made available on June
18 and 19.

It was emphasized that the two distribution
dates are to deliver orders only. No shirts will
be on sale, and no new orders will be accepted.

Employees who ordered shirts during the
information fair may pick them up between 7
and 9 a.m. in the Presidents Room and 2:15 to
3:45 p.m. in the Personnel Conference Room at
Cedar Crest & 1-78 onJune 18. At 17th &
Chew, distribution hours are from 7 to 9 a.m. in
Parlor A, School of Nursing, and from 2 to 4
p.m. in the Cafeteria Conference Room.

There were a number of winners in daily
drawings for T-shirts, movie tickets, coffee
mugs and gift certificates. They included:

T-Shirts: Carol Fox, CNS; Perie Combee,
Food Service; Rose Woodside, SSU; Ann
Hessinger, Volunteer Services; Roy Newhouser,
Dietary Services; Karen Moffat, OR; Michelle

Continued on Page 4
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Payroll Reminder
As a reminder, pay for working the July 4th
holiday will be different, depending on depart-
ment schedules. For those in a department with
a five-day (Monday-Friday) work week, and who
are required to work on Friday, July 3, pay will
be at time and a half for working the holiday.
For those in departments with a seven-day work
week pay, will be at time and a half for working
on July 4.

Additionally, some area banks will be open on
Friday, July 3, so paycheck distribution at 17th &
Chew remains the same. The cashier's office will
be open Friday, July 3 from 8 a.m. to 2 p.m.

Benefits Spotlight
A memorandum recently distributed to all
department heads indicates there is a limited
number of discounted credit bank courses
available at Lehigh County Community College.
As a reminder, the courses are available on first-
come, first-serve basis and there is a limit of one
per calendar year. Interested employees should
contact Marg Kratzer at ext. 8805 for a credit
bank form. Credit bank forms are only distrib-
uted through Human Resources.

The hospital has not yet received notification
about credit bank hours from Cedar Crest
College. A memorandum will be distributed to
all department heads when that information is
available.

David Shingles, MD, has been incorrectly listed
in the physicians directory since 1989 as being a
participating physician in the HealthEast Health
Plan. According to Human Resources, Shingles,
who practices at 1101 S. Cedar Crest Blvd.,
Allentown, is not a participating physician.

That means that the health plan will reimburse
only 65 percent of the fee schedule for office
visits after the deductible has been met. In
addition, the health plan will only reimburse 75
percent of the fee schedule for inpatient visits.

Those with questions about the changes should
contact Gerrianne Keiser at ext. 8839, Maryjane
Zanders at ext. 2930, or Leilani Souders, ext.
8807.

Alzheime(s Support Group
"Do You Remember Love?" will be the topic at

the next Alzheimer's Support Group meeting,
scheduled for June 26 from 1:30 to 3:30 p.m. at
the Ambulatory Geriatric Evaluation Service
(AGES), at 1243 S. Cedar Crest.

A film and discussion on the topic are planned
for the meeting, offered through the hospital's
Division of Geriatrics. For additional informa-
tion about the group, contact Patti Brill, MSW,
at ext. 9890.

HRD Programs
The next hospital orientation will begin at 8
a.m. at Cedar Crest & 1-78 on Monday, June 15
and an optional tour of both sites will be held
Wednesday,June 17 beginning at 1 p.m. at
17th & Chew and 2:30 p.m. at Cedar Crest &
1-78.

CPR recertification will be held in the 24 hour-
period beginning at 10 a.m. Wednesday, June
24, in the Pediatric Classroom, 5th Floor at
17th & Chew.

CPR certification, for which pre-registration is
required by calling ext. 2430, will be held in two
parts and attendance is required for both. Part 1
will be held July 9 and Part II onJuly 15.
Times and locations for both are 9 a.m. to noon
in SON Room 900, 17th & Chew.

Geriatrics Interest Network
"Depression in the Elderly" will be the topic of
a presentation by Michael W. Kaufmann, MD,
Chairman, Department of Psychiatry, at the
next meeting of the Geriatrics Interest Net-
work, to be held June 17 at 11:30 a.m. in the
cafeteria conference room, Cedar Crest & 1-78.

In the meantime, a group of subcommittees of
the network continue to review various aspects
of hospital service to the elderly ranging from
parking issues to directional information.
Among the sensitivity training plans being
considered is a group of booths for employees
to try simulations of things that affect older
persons.

Specialized patient education material needs
and development of a booklet on community
resources are also under study.

The Geriatrics Interest Network has attracted
widespread interest among hospital employees,

Continued on Page 8
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SHAPING A WIN-WIN SOLUTION

Unique Idea Rescues Heart Station Employee
Holter monitor tapes, which record virtually
everything a cardiac patient's heart does over a
period of 24 hours, require interpretation by a
highly skilled technician using sophisticated
equipment.

And when an employee is a single parent who
suffers a serious illness that wipes out sick time
and disability, the financial prospects are cata-
strophic.

But Heart Station staff recently rallied to not
only protect the employment of an important
member of their team and also ensure the
workload didn't get backlogged.

Ellen Dwyer, non-invasive technician, Heart

''It keeps me frum sitting around contemplating my illness and
being depressed. I foel productive, and keep my self-esteem. "

Station, continues to battle a chronic illness and
recovery from an injury as well. She expects to
be back in about a month. But thanks to a
cooperative effort, she is still working on those
Holter monitor tapes, preparing the assessments
critical to physician evaluations of patients. In
effect, her in-box moved to her house.

When the idea was first proposed, Dwyer says
she was completely surprised but eager to accept
it. Financial stability was only a part of it. "It
keeps me from sitting around contemplating my
illness and being depressed," she says. "I feel
productive, and kept my self-esteem."

According to Nancy Carr, director, Cardiology,
Dwyer had drained benefits during her recovery,
but still had the capability of performing her job
at home. So, with the help of Michael Spleen,
director, Bio-Medical Engineering, and Randy
Stubits, director, Logistics, Materials Manage-
ment, the sophisticated computer equipment
used to scan the tapes was moved to Dwyer's
home.

Heart station staff pitched in by shuttling the
tapes and the reports between the hospital and
Dwyer's home, about five miles away, effectively

keeping Dwyer on the payroll. Additionally, co-
workers raised more than $4{)0 through a
benefit bake sale several weeks ago.

The arrangement "has worked out just great"
from a productivity point of view. Because she is
equipped with a fax machine, serious cardiac
situations can be reported immediately to
physicians, and she is available for emergency
assessments at any time of day.

But what's also been meaningful, she adds, is the
daily contact with co-workers. "I don't have any
family in the area," she observes, so the daily
deliveries of tapes offer the opportunity to stay
in touch socially as well as professionally.

Carr praises the teamwork involved, which not
only boosted morale but also avoided a potential
crisis in workload.

"These assessments require a highly-skilled
technician," she explains. Had Dwyer "slipped
through the cracks," it wouldn't have been easy
to find a replacement or pick up the slack. "It
worked out really well for everyone," she says.

But most of all, it worked out best for Dwyer. "I
can't begin to put into words what it has meant
to me. The people at the hospital are truly
helping me recuperate."

Meanwhile, in HRD ...
Barbara Gangemi, secretary, Human Resource
Development, wants everyone to know that
caring isn't limited to nursing units in the
hospital.

Having seen several instances where staff in
Human Resources and HRD rallied to support a
fellow employee in need of assistance, she would
like to thank supportive co-workers when her
son was diagnosed with cancer. Among the
most touching examples was the morning she
came to work and found an envelope under her
door. It contained $100, from an anonymous
benefactor.
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Parking Changes at Cedar Crest &1-78
near the MOBs, and night shift will be located in
MOB areas These, too, will be card-access lots.

The advantage of the arrangement is that it puts
the respective shifts all in the same areas, which
allows for more effective patrol by Security.
The changes affect walking distance inside the
building, depending on specifically where one
works. For some, it will be a shortened walk,
while others will have extra steps.

Access to the visitor lot will be changed to a style
similar to that used at the Fairgrounds Medical
Center at 17th & Chew - there will be a guard
and a gate. And because Security now has
vehicle license plate numbers on file, it will be
able to monitor possible abuses of the system.
More important, though, will be such courtesies
as being able to track down a specific employee
to remind them that their headlights were left
on and to focus patrols in specific parking areas.

This same procedure may also apply at 17th &
Chew, where minor adjustments to lot assign-
ments are anticipated after The Allentown Fair.
According to Security, it's a matter of using lots

Continued from••
Page One

to maximum capacity. Among the concerns that
will be resolved at 17th & Chew is access to the
middle shift lot, which will soon return to card
access status.

But parking is just the beginning for the poten-
tial of the ID badges. Some areas, such as
Psychiatry, Pharmacy and the Library, are using
the cards to monitor access to specific areas, and
Jerry Kresge, director, Security, predicts that it's
only the beginning.

In just one recent 20-day period, 38,000 transac-
tions were recorded for everything from parking
to access of specific areas. Each time a card is
used, there's a record of the "transaction," not
unlike use of ordinary credit cards. The ID card,
programmed to permit entry into specific
parking lots, can also be set up to allow or limit
entry into specific areas of the hospital.

Because of the electronic trail left by a card,
abuses can be easily traced. And, in the event of
a lost ID badge, a few strokes on a keyboard can
invalidate any access at all.

Hospital Information Fair
Groover, Dietary Services; Kathleen Koch,
Blood Bank; Samantha Sproul, ACU; Clarinda
Gero, ACU; Ginny Daddona, 4T; Albert
Weber, Pharmacy; Beve Benjamin, ST; Gary
Stone, Social Services; Sally Sherman, Home
Care; Ruth Brobst, Medical Records; Kathleen
Cochrane, NICU; Kathy Ray, Poison Center;
Loretta Sanget, Nursing; and Nadine Ritter,
Food Service.

Muvie Tickets: Carolyn Frantz, CCL;Jean
Hagenbuch, Medical Records; Denise Wolst,
Speech Pathology;James Rotherham, Finance;
Debra D'Amico, Nursing; Susan Wallaesa,
Nursing; Evelyn Uhler, Adult Psychiatry;
Bonnie Bird, Radiology;Janice Kunsman, ST;
and Sandra Berk, 3T.

Mugs: Rev. Thomas Keener, visiting clergy;
Charles McDonald, 7C; Mary Nagel, Volunteer
Services; Don Connell, Anesthesia; Linda
Marks, 4C; Mary Ann Held, SPD; Stephanie

Hanzl, STU; Randi Panousis, Volunteer Ser-
vices; Mary Matthews, Volunteer Services; Beth
Czekner, GICU; Mary Ellen Sandholm, Chem-
istry; Steve Erbrick, Nursing; Ted Cline,
Medical Records; Michele Graver, Home Care;
Pam Snyder, Engineering; John Sanka, OR;
Carol Wimer, NICU; Mark Zelkovic, Surgery;
Barbara Miller, Finance; and Karen Aschenbach,
Business Office.

Gift certificates: Lester Herman, Volunteer
Services; Cindy Orlando, 4B; Gail Fox, Pathol-
ogy;Judy Weiss, SSU; Connie Mugavero, Labs;
Sandy Keefer, Business Office; Kim Granese,
Admitting; Laurie Jay, NICU; Donna
Petruccelli, Nursing; and Thomas Donatelli,
Food Service.

Wmners may pick up their prizes and coupons
for prizes during the same hours as delivery of
orders.
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Remember
when the Blue
Bombers were
reaDysoaring?

Leading the
charge on

environmental
safety

ABOUT OUR PEOPLE

Standing Tall in the HaD of Fame
Judging from his height, a lot of people suspect
Randy Stubits, director, Logistics, Materials
Management, might have once played a little
basketball. But not many know he was a real
star of the game, having recently been named
the eighth member of the Ursinus College Hall
of Fame for Athletes.

The 1976 Ursinus graduate was a four-year
letter winner who put 1,119 points on the board
to become ninth on the college's all-time
scoring list. His average of 14.9 points per game
stands as the third best career scoring average
for players over 1,000 career points at Ursinus.
He was named the team's most valuable player
in his sophomore, junior and senior years.

Stubits was also named to the first team all-
MAC in his senior year, and was a member of
the Ursinus team commended by then President
Richard Nixon for heroism in rescuing victims
of a hotel fire in Huntingdon, Pa.

Natives of the area who followed high school
ball in the early 70's might recall Stubits at
Palmerton High School, when the Blue Bomb-
ers made back-to-back District 11 Class A
tournament appearances.

Beth Cepil, MEd, MT(ASCP), SM(MM),
director, laboratory services, Clinical Laborato-
ries, recently gave a presentation at the Pennsyl-
vania Society for Medical Technology annual
spring meeting in "White Haven. The presenta-
tion was titled Quality Assessment in the 90's -
Preparingfar the Future.

Lynn Dashner, LPN, GI Lab and president of
the Pennsylvania Society of Gastroenterology
Nurses and Associates, co-presented a resolution
to the House of Delegates at the annual educa-
tion course of the Society of Gastroenterology
Nurses and Associates in San Francisco. The
resolution was to promote environmental safety
standards in order to protect employees from
immediate adverse reactions and to support
research into the long-term effects of glutaralde-
hyde exposures. The resolution was passed and a
research grant from the society is pending. The
Food and Drug Administration has shown

interest in the project and has asked to be kept
informed.

Valorie A. Shanaberger, GN, Float Pool,
recently graduated with honors from Lehigh
County Community College. She received an
Associate Degree in Applied Nursing, and
during graduation ceremonies also received the
1992 ADN Student Recognition Award. In
addition, the United States Achievement Acad-
emyannounced Shanaberger as an All-American
Scholar and named her as a United States
National Collegiate Nursing Award winner.

Carol Fox, RN, BSN, CCRN, staff nurse, CNS
Unit, was the recipient of the Neuroscience
Scholarship Award given at the Neuroscience
Recognition Dinner on May 2 at Brookside
Country Club.

Sandra Karwaski, RN, BSN, MSN, staff nurse,
Special Care Unit, recently received her master's
degree in nursing from Allentown College.

KarenJuszczuk, RN, BSN, staff nurse, 7C,
recently passed her certification examination in
medlsurg nursing.

Theresa Beers, RT, X-Ray tech, Radiology
graduated in May from Cedar Crest College
with a degree in nuclear medicine.

Fourteen nurses were among May 9 graduates
from the College of St. Francis in Joliet, Ill.,
receiving bachelor's degrees. They include:
Charlotte Buckenmyer, RN; Rosemary
Cerimele, RN; Marilyn Rohrbach, RN;
Renee Schick, RN; and Beverly Snyder, RN,
all of Emergency Department; Linda Coy, RN,
ICU; Mary Cramsey, RN, SSU; Arnette
Odenwelder, RN, Hemophilia Center; Peg
Parry, RN, Poison Center; Josephine
Cannariato, RN, GI Lab; Diane Popovich,
RN, Admitting; Barbara Ann Wachter, RN,
Clinics; and Dorothy Deegan, RN, TCU.
Buckenmyer received special honors for achiev-
ing a 4.0 grade point average for the entire
program, while Parry was selected to deliver the
class oration and received a special award for
meritorious service.
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Kay~
indomitable

spirit, cheerful
attitude and

optimistic
outlod: enabled
her to return to

herjobmuch
faster than

anyone would
have imagined.
- Kathleen Marth
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Kay Tricano Receives WomanCare Award
Catherine Tricano, administrative assistant,
Administration, was one of two recipients of the
1992 WomanCare of the Year Award presented
at a special program onjune 2.

The award is given to women who have sur-
mounted a major challenge over their own
health and who have those special qualities that
inspire others.

Also recognized was Helene M. Whitaker,
director of Planning, Research and Government
Relations at Northampton County Area Com-
munity College and active in a number of civic
and community organizations.

Both recipients were recognized for "overcom-
ing obstacles that would defeat the average
person" and possessing a "never-say-die atti-
tude."

Tricano in recent years has been a traffic acci-
dent victim, had a mastectomy, thyroidectomy
due to malignancy, and most recently fractured
her arm and hip.

Described by Paul Nurick, executive vice
president and COO, and Kathy Marth, adminis-
trative assistant to the COO as having a positive
and cheerful attitude and providing an example
for all with whom she worked. In each instance,
she recuperated rapidly and returned to her job

ABOUT OUR
PEOPLE,
CONTINUED

Births:
• To Andrea Keener, RN, staff nurse, NICV,
and her husband, jeremiah, a daughter, Brittany
Marie Keener, on May 25. She weighed 8Ibs., 4
oz., was 20 112inches in length, and has a sister,
Brianna.

• To Tracy Silfies, RN, BSN, staff nurse, 5C,
and her husband, Dean, a son, Tyler Dean
Silfies, on May 12. He weighed 61bs., 5 oz., and
was 19 112 inches long.

• To Donna Czonstka, RN, staff nurse, 5C,
and her husband, Chris, a daughter, Amanda
Lynn Czonstka, on May 4. She weighed 8 lbs,
10 oz., and has a sister, Megan.

as soon as possible. Further, they wrote, "she
refused to be catered to and got on with business
as usual."

They add that her "greatest fear during her most
recent hospitalization for the fractures was
having to be dependent on someone," and cited
her as "an excellent role model."

OfTricano, Nurick wrote, "Warmth, kindness
and a willingness to help in any way required
abound in this unusual person. These attributes
coupled with adherence to the highest profes-
sional standards have made Kay an invaluable
co-worker."

Another nomination came from Marie
Signarovitz, RN, a longtime friend who says,
"Kay taught me to consistently view life as a gift.
She taught me to view our work beyond the
tasks and techniques of daily life and to see the
work of helping others as a lifelong commitment
to caring and love in action."

Whitaker has a genetic disability, dwarfism, that
requires her to walk with the assistance of leg
braces, and she recently had cataracts removed
from both eyes. Despite that, she is considered
one of the Lehigh Valley's top planners and has
served on numerous boards and municipal
entities over the years .

• To Brenda Rocchino, Engineering, and her
husband, George, a son, jordan Taylor
Rocchino on March 5. He weighed 8lbs, 9 oz.,
was 21 inches long, and has a sister, Gabrielle.

• To Michael Patrick Gee, patient escort,
Mailroom, and his wife, Diane Marie Gee, a
son, Timothy Michael, on May 7. A twin
brother, Casey Patrick Gee, was stillborn.
Timothy weighed 6Ibs., 4 oz., was 19 112 inches
long, and has a sister, Belinda Beverly.

• To Terry Romanishan, office manager, Burn
Prevention Foundation, and her husband, Ted,
a son, Alexander Thomas Romanishan, on
March 30. He weighed 6Ibs., 13 oz., was 20

Continued on Page 8
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Friends of Nursing Salutes Best In Units
At its annual reception, Friends of Nursing
recently presented awards to a number of
Lehigh Valley Hospital nurses. They included:

Jere and Bonnie Smith Ambulatory Care Award:
Eleanor Good, RN, Emergency.

Cardiac Nursing Award: Roberta Hower, RN,
TOHU.

Ihrie Digestive Sciences Nursing Award: Debra
Matta, RN, 4B.

Joan Gaylor, RN and Donald Gaylor, MD
Medical-Surgical Nursing Award: Sonja
Mendez, RN, 4S.
Salvadore Award for Excellence in Medical-
Surgical Nursing: Charlotte Palko, RN,
TOHU.

Franges Excellence in Neuroscience Nursing
Award: Marjorie Lavin, RN, CNS.

ObstetridGynecologic Nursing Award:
Deborah Sipos, RN, 3T.

M.G. Asnani, MD Award for Excellence in
Pediatric Nursing: Loretta Gogel, RN, Pediat-
ncs.
Dr. and Mrs. Joseph Prorok Award for Excel-
lence in Peri operative Nursing: Glenda Bonano,
RN,OR.

[- '\

\

Cheryl Mclaughlin, Medical Transcription, explains the services of the
department in keeping medical records current The department celebrated
National Medical Transcription Week with a display in the Anderson Wing
lobby at Cedar Crest & 1-78and hosted a day-long symposium that featured
presentations on topics ranging from cardiology to AIDS.

/

Allentown Anesthesia Associates Post Anesthesia
Care Nursing Award: Hugh Marsh, RN,
PACU.

Psychiatric Nursing Award: Maryrose
Dorwood, RN, Psychiatry.

Trauma Nursing Award: Linda Reinhart, RN,
Shock Trauma.

Boyer Award for Outstanding Nurse Preceptor:
Tom Gavigan, RN, Emergency.

Dr. W. Richard and Mary Anne Covert Award
for Excellence in Nursing Education, Patient
Education and Research: Rita Bendekovits, RN,
NEPER.

Fleming Award for Community Service: Joseph
Rycek, RN, Emergency.
Fleming Award for Nursing Innovation: Andrea
Parry, RN, GICU-E.
Fleming Award for Nursing Quality: Joan
Livesay, RN, Pediatrics.
Kinneman Award for Nursing Leadership:
Marilyn Guidi, RN, Shock Trauma.
Josephine Ritz Nursing Excellence in Patient!
Family Teaching Award: Linda Spengler, RN,
4C.
Samuels Nursing Compassion Award: Elizabeth
Egan-Lee, RN, Shock Trauma.
Samuels Nursing Ethics Award: Victoria
Geiger, RN, Labor & Delivery.
Nancy Stevens Educational Advancement
Award: Janis Croissette, RN, Burn Center.
Medical Staff Nursing Practice Awards:JoAnn
Bowan, RN, SC; Karen Brown, RN, Emer-
gency; and Norma Storer, RN, Emergency
Medical Staff LPN Awards: Susan Henritzy,
LPN, SA; and Joanne Martin, LPN, Clinics
Medical Staff Nursing Assistant Awards: Karen
Bieber, TOHU;Judith McFarland, Burn
Center; and Kathleen Miller, GICU-W.
Medical Staff Unit Clerk Awards: Ann Kuhns,
4C; Patricia Leshko, GICU-E; and Susan
Moyer,6B.

Special Recognition Awards: Donna Roth,
LPN, Medical Records; and Rose Trexler, RN,
Triage Supervisor.
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A Trauma Week Retrospective
Staff nurses who organized Trauma Awareness Week activities at Lehigh Valley Hospital
drew substantial audiences to a variety of programs and applause from system leadership
for a job well done. The week-long event included visits by 125 area school students,
tours of trauma areas for about 125 hospital employees, and a Friday evening reception
and reunion of 45 former trauma patients and their families. Among the speakers (far
right) was Billy Amos, who was a patient in Shock Trauma for nearly a year and narrowly
escaped death several times.

Above, Marilyn Guidi, RN, head nurse, STU, explains typical care protocols using a
mannequin for illustration purposes. But for trauma staff, the high point of the week was
on Thursday, when Craig Bell, RN, and Laura Beil, RN, (upper right) were among the
presenters of "Code Red - One of Our Own." While Tammy Sands, RN, STU, de-
scribed the clinical trail of Craig, critically injured in a traffic accident, the Beils provided
insigllt as to what it was like to be a patient and an anxious loved one. They believe the
experience enhanced professional skills in terms of providing care on their own unit,
GICU-W.

ABOUT OUR
PEOPLE,
CONTINUED

inches long and has a sister, Natasha Lynne
Romanishan.

• To Donna Strobl, RT, cat scan tech, Radiol-
ogy, and her husband, Brian, a daughter,
Chelsea, on May 28. She weighed 7 lbs., 4 oz.

Engagements:

• Mike Mahlon, X-ray student, Radiology, to
Brandy Bime. No wedding date has been set.

Weddings:

• Sandra Decelle, RPh, Pharmacy, to David
D'Allesandro on May 2. The couple honey-
mooned in Jamaica.

What' s News: Geriatrics
Network Takes Active Role
Continued from Page 2

particularly in the subcommittee areas where a
recent survey led to five specific areas of work,
all involving the means of improving service to
patients and visitors and environmental/equip-
ment concerns.

For additional information about the network,
contact Lisa Lacko, RN, Division of Geriatrics,
ext. 9890, or Mary DeHaven, Prestige Health,
ext. 7370.
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The Marketplace
Items for Sale Items for Sale Vehicles for Sale Real Estate for Sale
Schwinn. boy's 24'.10 speed stools. like new. $150. Call 262- condition. 64.000 miles. redline used as two unit apt. or one
bicycle. Caliente model. excellent 3148. Michelin tires. Call 439-0047. large house. minutes from 1-78
condition. $70. Call 434-8471. Lifestyle 700 exercise bike. 1988 Plymouth Colt. 4 DR. Air. and Route 22. Off street parking.
Coal stove. Franco Beige. brown hardly used. $125 or best offer. PS. AM/FM/Cass. auto. dark large yard. Terms negotiable.
ceramic. one year old. orig. 1983 Kawasaki GP21100 drag blue. clean. 80.000 miles. $3.500. Needs a few repairs. $80.000.
$1.300. sell for $850. Call 760- bike with air shift. slick. and Call 434-1483 after 5 p.m. available July 1. Call 866-81.53
9999. wheely bar. plus 3 bike trailer. 1985 Dodge Aries SW 2.2L. EFI after 6 p.m.

Regulation size slate top pool $3000. Four Perrelli P6 tires. size engine. PS. PB. AC. AM/FM/ West End Allentown row house.
215V66015. brand new. $100 Cassoruns great. clean. 69.000 hardwood floors. ornamentaltable. excellent condition. each. Call 432-3567. fireplace. tree-lined street. 3 BA.recently refinished. asking $500 orig miles. maint. records

or best offer. Call 866-1 079. Cherry crib w/Gerber mattress available. $2.400. Call 799-0626. full basement. Anxious to sell.
and matching cherry changing 1990 Mazda 626 LX 5 door. AT. Price reduced to $67.580 ..Call'

Stone blue area rug. 8x12. best 437-9371.
offer. Call 965-3859. table. two sets of sheets w/ PB. PS.AM/FM/Cass. power

comforter and sham. never used. moonroof. low mileage. excellent For sale or rent: house in
Tires - only 4.000 original all in very good condition. asking condition. $10.800 or best offer. spectacular wood setting
miles. 185fl5-13. tread lock. $325. Playpens. good condition. Call 821-8279. overlooking Little Lehigh Parkway
speed rated. $150 (originally asking $30 each. Baby toys and

1987 Saab 900. red. 4 door. very with country club in back yard.
$300). Nine foot wide wooden girls clothes sizes 0-3. Call 838- Five min from Cedar Cfest & 1-78.
used garage door with hardware. 7290. low miles. excellent condition. Call 866-1899.
Good condition. Free. Utility $6.200. Call 965-3612.
trailer. 5x7 with cargo box. brand Hoover upright sweeper with

1977 Chevy 4x4. 1/2 ton pickup. Gorgeous conternporarv
attachments. Model U4503-9OO. townhouse just 7 min. fFom'new. never used. $175. Call 435- like new. $35. Dirt devil. $15. Call 350 V8. AC. AT. PS. PB. mechan- Cedar Crest & 1-7B.38111,.2·1/26922 evenings. 967-1906. ics and body in good condition. baths. garage. cathedral'ceiling.low mileage. Call 262-4045.AKC yellow lab puppies. OFA heat pump. easy to take €.aneof.

registered with champion sire. Items for Rent 1979 Plymouth Trailduster 4x4. private yard. ParklaOOiS€ihmols.
Call 346-6624. Dining canopy. 2ox3o. for outdoor new paint and interior. exc. $112.000.
Dining oom set. 1920s oak and parties. $85 delivered and set up. condition. must see. many extras. West End Allentown. '2'Sl!am{
walnut. 10 pieces. absolutely Call 398-1713. $6.000 neg. Call 264-3028. brick single. 3 BR. LA"1illilI.,~at-in
perfect. serious inquiries only Vehicles for Sale 1986 Nissan Sentra. 2 dr. kitchen. 1 1/2 baths, fal!Ji1il~room
please. Call 717-325-2383. hatchback. 47.000 miles. w/wet bar. jalousied p&i€fu\.
GEVHS Camcorder 2-lux. still 1989 Chrysler Fifth Ave. 28.000 excellent cond .•AC is 2 yrs old. attached garage. ooW'cefitiFal AC
under warranty. 1 1/2 years old. mi. slate blue. loaded. $8.500. Dolby stereo with quad speakers. and gas heat. $135.9{]01.~1435-
used five or six times. like new. Call 3-10 p.m.. 262-7570. auto. sunroof. asking $3.500. 1897.
carrying case and strap. 1977 BMW 3201.one owner and Call 432-0757. 1989 Grey 2 BR Holley f.l'aJJk
autofocus. very compact and original paint. sunroof. stick shift. 1983 Mercedes Benz 300 TO. mobile home. 12x14 shOO)
easy to use. Battery and charger. $1.000. Call 435-5552 after 4 midnight blue. excellent condi- included. located at Terl)( Hill
AC plug. lighting attachment. p.m. tion, $10.500. Call 717-457-0159. Trailer Park. Take over payments
Paid over $700 new. all for $450. 1979 Dodge pickup. short bed. Real Estate for Sale or $24.000. Call391-91~.
Call 262-1415. 360. auto. $2000. Will trade for West End Allentown. :1 Gl:n 4r BR
Coal/wood stove. Vermont car of equal value. Call 377-9529. Whitehall bi-Ievel. 2 years old. all brick Cape Cod. totall¥'
casting (Vigilant). black. 50.000 1987 Mazda RX7 GXL. loaded. stone construction. 3 BR. 2 Bath. carpeted. new kitchen. full'
btu. excellent condition. $600. cruise. AC. pw. PS. Sunroof. 5 2 car attached garage. deck. basement. nicely landsfrclpecr.
Soloflex exerciser with leg and spd, stereo cassette. equalizer. landscaped. 10 min to 17th & convenient to both oosgJitailsites.
butterfly attachments. like new. 37.000 miles. Always garaged. Chew. very private. heat pump. $95.000. Call 433-65&1.
used 6 mos. Call 797-0121. leave mint condition inside. outside. CA. sunny lot. $124.000. Call

Salisbury ranch. 3 8H..t ]pZbath.message. mechanically. Call 434-2474. 262-1415.
kitchen. finished basemem1!"

Three light oak Windsor back bar 1974 Triumph TA6. excellent Two story home in Easton. can be
covered patio. low taxes. Many



Real Estate for sale Vacation Rentals Services New At Lehigh
extras. $99,900. Call 797-0802. one block from beach, board- and siding, replacement Valley Hospital

Real Estate for Rent walk. Call (609) 522-2911. windows, sidewalks and patios. Cafeterias:
Stone Harbor NJ - 5 BR beach Call 264-4327.

Emmaus - Apartments newly house, ocean view. Also 3 BR Childcare in a nurturing environ- FRESHrenovated, one and two BR units, ranch duplex, two blocks to ment, my home, 3 years and over.
walking distance to everything, beach. Call 439-0911 after 6 p.m. Activities. References available,
off street parking, garage neg. Whitehall area. Call 262-1872. CATCHCall 797-3587. Wanted
Emmaus - Garage/carport, Used microwave, 700 watts,

Childcare - dependable college OFTHEstudent available for babysitting
1Ox17, perfect shelter for car, small, needed for crowded office. in your home, full time. Call 434-
boat, camper, $30/month. Call Call 434-7102. 1228. DAY965-9631. Mature, non-smoking individual Housekeeping and grounds
West End Allentown house, 15th to care for child in my home, maintenance, dependable,
& Chew, 4 BR, LR, Eat-in kitchen, starting in September, 5 days! efficient hard worker. Must be on featuring fresh fish
full basement, $600/month plus week. Call 694-9203. bus routes. Call 435-3302. and fresh seafood
utilities. Available June 15. Call specials severalInexpensive playpen, high chair Lawn care/landscaping. Total398-6207. and crib needed. Call 965-3328. lawn maintenance, all work times monthy!
Vacation Rentals Mothers helper for summer to guaranteed, senior citizen
Avalon NJ - 2 BR cottage, 1 1/ help mother with four young discounts, fully insured. Call 965- Watch For
2 blocks to beach. $750 to $825 children. Drivers license, 5 day 2296.

Advertised
per week. Call 821-9526. week, 4-5 hours per day. Marble and tile installation, mud SpecialsAllentown area. Call 285-6541. set installation, free estimate.Myrtle Beach - 2 BR condo,

Services Call 262-1266. Throughoutone block from beach, $580/
The Summerweek. Call (803) 438-9678. Major renovations, remodeling, Months!Wildwood NJ - family motel, kitchens and bathrooms. Roofing

The Marketpillce is provided as a free
service to employees of Lehigh Valley
Hospital and is published in the first
edition of CheckUp each month. All
submissions must be on the attached
form and must include the employee's
name, department and a daytime
telephone number. Submissions
without this information will be
discarded. Only employees, volun-
teers and staff physicians may
submit items for publication.
Marketpillce ads may be run for only
two consecutive months, and must be
submitted for each edition of Market-
place. We reserve the right to reject,
revise or edit submissions and publica-
tion does not constitute an
endoresment of product or service.
Deadline for submissions is the last
day of the month preceding publica-
tion.
Send submissions to Marketplace,
Public Relations, 1243SCC.
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Copy (please print or type) _

Home Phone (will appear in ad) _

Submittedby _

Department Daytime Ext.. _


