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The data yielded from this study can 
used to guide EM resident education. 
Specifically, educational lectures will 
be made based on frequently asked 
topics. 

Comparison and Outcome Analysis of E.M. Resident
Evidence-Based Medicine Questions

Over the span of 7 years (2013-2020), 
a total of 10,450 logs were collected 
from residents. 10,401 logs were 
included in the final analysis after 45 
logs were removed due to blank 
submissions or submissions of 
singular letters. An additionally 4 logs 
were removed as they were exact 
replicas of previous questions. Table 2 
represents the final scores obtained 
from all 10,401 logs. Scores in each 
category ranged from 0 to 3. Overall, 
the score for C for all residents was 
0.27. The score for O for all residents 
was 0.73. 
The score for outcome was higher 
compared to the score of comparison. 
Both categories demonstrated very 
high numbers of zero scores. 
Specifically, 9282 submissions 
receiving a score of zero for 
comparison.

A reasonable explanation as to why 
results are lower than expected is due 
to the fact that EM residents are often 
pressed for time. Therefore, the latter 
portions of questions, comparison 
and outcome, may be neglected. 
Residents would benefit from 
education on the importance of 
inclusion of comparison and outcome 
in EBM questions. This will allow 
residents to tailor treatments to each 
patient as part of values-based patient 
centered care. Additionally, residents 
will have these educational lectures at 
their disposal to use whenever 
possible. Self-directed learning will 
hence be efficient and thorough as 
residents continue their training from 
PGY1 to PGY4.

• EM residents were asked to submit 
EBM logs on shift in the Emergency 
Department (ED).

• Postgraduate years (PGY) 1 through 
4 were included. 

• Logs were submitted by residents 
via New InnovationsTM. 

• Information provided in the logs 
included: chief complaint, discharge 
diagnosis, ED or hospital course, 
clinical question, clinical question 
answer, and method for obtaining an 
answer. 

• Logs were subsequently analyzed 
via the Fresno rubric of Population-
Intervention-Comparison-Outcome 
(PICO), which was defined by 
Ramos et al, BMJ, 2003.

• Table 1 demonstrates an adaptation 
of the Fresno rubric analyze the C 
and O of each log. 

Problem Statement

Evidence Based Medicine (EBM) is 
fundamentally important to treat 
patients. There is minimal data 
describing how emergency medicine 
(EM) residents incorporate EBM in 
their clinical questioning strategy

This retrospective project seeks to
determine how EM residents
document comparison (C) and
outcome (O) within their EBM
questions.
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